PT.SUPRACO INDONESIA
S @ 2nd Floor, JI.Kapten Tendean No.24

Mampang Prapatan

Jakarta 12720 - Indonesia

Phone : 7191070 (Hunting)
SUPRACO Fax.: 7191077

e-mail : finance@supraco.com

ORIGINAL

P
Invoice No. : P10690/INV/2025
PT. DOWELL ANADRILL SCHLUMBERGER Company Code 112
Gedung Wisma Mulia Lantai 45, Jalan Jend. Gatot Subroto No.42, RT.003 RW.002 Date : 27 October 2025
Kuningan Barat, Mampang Prapatan, Jakarta Selatan, DKI JAKARTA 12710 Contract No. : CW2712367 A No.2
Contract Expiration Date : 31 December 2026
For the period of : OCTOBER 2025
Customer No. :
Contract Scope : LABOR SUPPLY PROJECT Requester : Finance Dept / Account Payable
No Part No Description PO NUMBER GR NUMBER [ COST CENTER| Quantity Unit Price Total
LOCATION : DURI IDR
1 | SUPRACO|SUM VAR OCTOBER 2025 - 1-30 SEPTEMBER 2025 ID100002 1 261,844,900 261,844,900
DAS DNM
261,844,900

Total Payment

PT. Supraco Indonesia
NPWP : 01.306.780.6.062.000

Note : Please find the

| certify that this Invoi

attachment (Billing Summary)

Total Payment by Schlumberger

261,844,900

InWords: |( Rupiah : Two Hundred Sixty One Million Eight Hundred Forty Four Thousand Nine Hundred Only )

ce is true and correct that payment thereof has not

been Invoiced or received previously.

Please remit to :
PT. SUPRACO INDONESIA

Bank Account : 905.021069.900

Bank Name : HSBC INDONESIA

Adress

: WTC Building Jakarta

Swift Code : HSBCIDJA

Name : NOVIA INGGRIANI

Title : PROJECT MANAGER




PERIOD : OCTOBER 2025
PERIODE TIMESHEET : 1 - 30 SEPTEMBER 2025
SUPRACO PROJECT : CW 2712367 (INDIVIDUAL SCHLUMBERGER]

Spc BILLING SUMMARY (BACK UP INVOICE)

! 687717736823000 | Muhamad Edwin Sahit LA DD Speialist Dam oas | D100002 1,200,000.00 1.200.000.00 1,200,000.00 3.000,000.00, 3,000,000.00 54,200,000 5,382,500.00 1,529.20.00 6,911,790.00 61,111,790.00 3,361,14845 64472938 4
2 544405047811000 | Catur Muhariab 171144 DD Specialist Cross Train DX Dam oAs | ID100002 2,600,000.00, 2,600,000.00 44,600,000 | 4.250,000.00 3.728.500.00. 7,078,500.00 2,601,817.50 47031750
3 Prayoga 171261 DD Specialist D&M DAs | ID100002 6.126,000.00. 6.126,000.00, 6.126,000.00. 0.00) 0.00 6,126,000 0.00 000 6,126,000.00 33693000 6.462.030.00.
4 Dedy Saputra 172738 DD Specialist Cross Train DX Dam oas | ID100002 300,000.00 7.300,000.00| 30000000 1,800.000.00 1,800,000,00' 29,100,000 0.00 000 29,100,000.00 1,600,500.00 30.700,500.00
Nev|_s Robbi And 1727102 DD Specialist Cross Train DX D&M 0As | ID100002 2.800,000.00, 2,800,000.00 41,150,000 3.770,840.00, 3,770,840.00 44,020,84 2.470,646.20 47.301.486.20.
Nev| 6 720952860326000 | Edi Yanto Ginting 1727103 DD Specialist Cross Train DX D&M 0As | ID100002 42,900,000.00 42,900,000.00] 42,900,000.00 2.300,000.00, 2,300,000.00 45,200,000 9,167,080.00. 9,157,080.00 54,367,080.00 2,089,647.40 57,346,727 40




Zimbra https://mserver.supraco.com/h/printmessage?id=145136&tz=Asia/Bangkok

Zimbra mitra.dewi@supraco.com

Timesheet September 2025 Edi Yanto Ginting (Revise 1)

From : Nada Salsabila Irsani <NIrsani@slb.com> Wed, Oct 08, 2025 02:52 PM
Subject : Timesheet September 2025 Edi Yanto Ginting (Revise 1) 3 attachments
To : Mitra Dewi <mitra.dewi@supraco.com>, fadhil adha <fadhil.adha@supraco.com>
Cc : Putri Dian Maharani <PMaharani@slb.com>, La Wangiwana <LWangiwana@slb.com>

Dear Mba @mitra.dewi and Mas @fadhil.adha@supraco.com,

Please find below comments:

September
No Name Timesheet Comment [Final Count
CORE IMeal
1 Edi Yanto Ginting » Add 0.5x20 additional bonus for one man 33 23

show = 10
(Core + additional bonus

= 23+10)

Expenses are approved from my end.

Thank you.
Best Regards,
Nada

SLB-Private

From: Edi Yanto Ginting <EGinting2@slb.com>
Sent: Thursday, October 2, 2025 11:57 PM
To: Nada Salsabila Irsani <NIrsani@slb.com>

1 dari 2 09/10/2025, 08.00



ING EXPENSE STATEMENT

Employee
Gl : BOORBATA Date
Naime T EDIYANTO GINTING Segment/Department - WEM DEM
Accounting Unit Manager © ELVIAN H. BARUS
Activity Code Purpose
Lejgal £ ity
[ oo only NOltiple Curroncies [ OBussiness Related O Parsonnel Related ]
5 -2025 Flight fram Solo to PEU (urgent) 185 85
3eR-2025 ing tri ) 76
- 2025 Trip from Origin to PKU Alrport (urgent) 749920 749920
5-Sep-2025 Travel Irom PKU (Airport) to Duri {ﬂrimu 70
-50p-2025 Meal for crew on Rig ACS-19 Well 37-45E 500000/ 3
7-5ep-2025 Meal before job on Rig ACS-19 W AT-A5E 16000 21
8-5ep-2025 Meal after job o 19 Well 3T-45E g 29,
10-5ep-2025 Meal for crew on Rig ACS-17 Well 6H-02038
10-5ep-2025 Meal before job on Rig ACS-17 Well 6H-02038 205000, 20
3-50p-2025 Meal after job on_ Rig AC5-17 Well 6H-02038 25 550
17-Sep-2025 Meal for cr [i] 7 Well 5H-09048 SO0 y
17-5ep-2025 Meal before job on Rig ACS-17 Well 5H-09048 265000 2
19-5ep-2025 17 Il 5H-0904 8 27 700
[20-5ep-2025 Meal for crew on Rig ACS- 9!}5_%] gs-nr 5
1-50p-202%5 Meal betore job on Rig ACS-19 Well 35-71F 2
|23-5ep-2025 <19 Well 35-71F 2 1
|23-2ep:202% = LIRSE 3T-22K ;
24 2 job an R 01, Well DSF 3T-22F 28, 282000
il?vStE-ZOgS Meal after job on Rig ARJ-01, Well DSF 3T-22F 236000/ 23
28-5ep-2025 Mgn[ lor crew on Rig GW-338, Well P_KERAZS P06 5l
28-5ep-2025 Meal before job on Rig GW-338, Well P_KERA25_PO6 213000] 213000

undry team on Rig GW-338 Well BN R
P/A - Cash Advance

[ | haretry cortify that the above expenditures ware spent for legitimate Company business anly 1
— Claimat, —-—mr — o
- |

= Manager Approval e e
lDlt- ]
——— e Gyt kit Apptoval ==
o i

Bank Information
10# Account LSS Account
UsS Account

Beneliciary:
Bank: Mandiri
Account: 5000030124854




PT. SUPRACO INDONESIA
TIMESHEET FOR SPECIALIST OF SCHLUMBERGER

i d

: EDI YANTO GINTING MONTH :Septembar 2025
:DDX

1 1-Sep-25 OFF

2 2-5ap-25 OFF

3 3-Sep-I5 OFF

4| 4sepis OFF

5 5-Sep-25 ON DSF 3T45E On duty at Rig ACS19 ¥ v 05 additional bonus for one man show

6| 6Sep-2% ON DSF 3T-45E On duty at Rig ACS19 v v 0.5 additiona) bonus for one man shaw
7 7-Sep-25 ON DSF IT4SE On duty at Rig ACS19 v v 0.5 additional bonus for one man show
8 B-Sep-25 ON DSF 3T-45E O duty ot Rig ACS19 W v 0.5 additiona! bonus for cne man show
9 | 9-Sep-25 CN DSF 3T4SE On duty at Rig ACS19 ] ¥ 0.5 additional bonus for one man show
10| 10-5ep-25 ON D5F 6:4-02038 On duty at Rig ACS17 v ¥ 0.5 additional bonus for one man show
11| 11-Sep-28 OoN DSF 6H-02033 On duty at Rig ACS17 v v 0.5 additional bonus for ore man show
12| 12-5ep-25 ON DSF 6H-02038 On duty 3t Rig ACS17 v v 0.3 additional bonus for ons man show
13| 13-5ep-25 oM DSF 64020358 {On duty at Rig ACS17 v ¥ 0.5 additional bonus for one man show
14| 14-Sep-25 | STANDEY

15| 1S-Sep-25 | STANDSY
15| 16-Sep-25 | STANDEY

17| 17-Sep-15 ON DSF SH-09048 |On duty at Rig ACS17 v d 0.5 additiona! bonus for one man show
15| 18-Sep-S ON DSE 5409048 (On duty at Rig ACS17 ¥ v 0.5 2dd | bonus for one man show
19| 19-5ep-25 OoN DSF SH-09048 (On duty at Rig AGL7 ¥ v 0.5 additional bonus for one man show
20| 20-5ep-25 ON DSF SH-05048 On duty at Rig ACS17 ¥ v 0.5 sdditional bonus for cne man show
21| 21-Sep-25 ON DSF 35-71F On duty st Rig ACS19 v v 0.5 additional bonus for cne man show
22| 22-Sep-2% ON DSF 35-71F {On duty st Rig ACS19 b v 0.5 sdditonal bonus for cne man show
23| 23-5ep-25 ON DSF 35-71F :On duty at Rig ACS19 W v 0.5 additional bonus for one man show
24| 24-Sep-2% ON DSF 37-22€ {On duty at Rig ARIDL ) v 0.5 additional bonus for cne man show
25| 25-Sep-25 ON DSF 37-228 On duty at Rig ARIDL v v 0.5 24ditions! bonus for one man show

26| 26-Sep-25 ON DSF 3T-22E On duty at Rig ARJOL v v 0.5 additional bonus for cne man show
27| 27-5ap-35 OoN DSF 37-228 On duty 2t Rig ARJ0L v v 0.5 additions! bonus for cns man show
28| 28-Sep-25 ON P_KERAZS_PD6 On duty at Rig GW338 v v
23| 29-Sep-25 ON P_KERA2S_PO6 On duty at Rig GW333 ¥ v

30| 30-Sep-25 ON P_KERA25_FOS [On duty at Rig GW338 v o

PREPARED BY, REVIEWED BY, APPROVED BY,




cimora https://mserver.supraco.com/h/printmessage?id=145169&tz=Asia/Bangkok

Zimbra mitra.dewi@supraco.com

FW: Timesheet_September 2025

From : Nada Salsabila Irsani <NIrsani@slb.com> Thu, Oct 09, 2025 08:23 AM
Subject : FW: Timesheet_September 2025 1 attachment
To : Mitra Dewi <mitra.dewi@supraco.com>, fadhil adha <fadhil.adha@supraco.com>
Cc : Putri Dian Maharani <PMaharani@slb.com>, Harsa Maulana Prayoga <HPrayoga@slb.com>, La Wangiwana
<|Wangiwana@slb.com>

Dear Mba @mitra.dewi and Mas @fadhil.adha@supraco.com,

Approved with below comments:

September

No | Name Timesheet Comment [Final Count

CORE IMeal Tier 1 Tier 3

1 Harsa Prayoga 3 - - -
Thank you.
Best Regards,
Nada

SLB-Private

From: Harsa Maulana Prayoga <HPrayoga@slb.com>

Sent: sunday, October 5, 2025 7:24 AM

To: La Wangiwana <LWangiwana@slb.com>; Nada Salsabila Irsani <Nlrsani@slb.com>
Cc: putri Dian Maharani <PMaharani@slb.com>; mitra.dewi@supraco.com
Subject: Timesheet_September 2025

Dear Madam & Sir,

Please kindly accept my Timesheet for September 2025 in the attachment.
Kindly need Your Approval.

Thank You and Regards,

Harsa Maulana Prayoga

I dari 2 09/10/2025, 08.25



Zimbra https://mserver.supraco.com/h/printmessage?id=144657&tz=Asia/Bangkok

Zimbra mitra.dewi@supraco.com

FW: Time Sheet & Expense September 2025 Robbi A

From : Nada Salsabila Irsani <NIrsani@slb.com> Fri, Oct 03, 2025 10:21 PM
Subject : FW: Time Sheet & Expense September 2025 Robbi A ~ 3 attachments
To : Mitra Dewi <mitra.dewi@supraco.com>, fadhil adha <fadhil.adha@supraco.com>

Cc : La Wangiwana <LWangiwana@slb.com>, Putri Dian Maharani <PMaharani@slb.com>,
Robbi Andriyanto <RAndriyanto@slb.com>

Dear Mba @mitra.dewi and Mas @fadhil.adha@supraco.com,

Please find below comments:

September
No Name Timesheet Comment Final Count
CORE Meal
1 Robby Andriyanto e Add 3x0.5 bonus for one man show= 1.5 29.5 28

(core + additional = 28+1.5)

Expenses are approved

Thank you
Best Regards,
Nada

SLB-Private

From: Robbi Andriyanto <RAndriyanto@slb.com>
Sent: Thursday, October 2, 2025 6:43 PM
ToO: Putri Dian Maharani <PMaharani@slb.com>

| dari 2 06/10/2025, 08.16



ING EXPENSE STATEMENT

Employes
Gin ROCEANGT Date - Sept 2025
Harme ROBM ANDRIYANTD Segment/Department - WOM - DEM
Accounting Wit Managpet : TLVIAN H BARLS [ LA WANGIWANA
Activity Code Purpine
Legal € Entity

[ v iowonly WCuhtiple Currencins [ Obusuness Aelated O Pemonnel Related |
Snack Crew rig ARI-02 location DSF_SK-168 313000
1M|MI’II Water group & softdrink rig crew ARI-02 220000
Taxi from home to Soeeta Airport 210000
]Mul at Pekanbary Airport 05000
Travel Pekanbaru Airport to Durl 0000
Meal Group to DSF_SK-168 ARJ-02 123750
Meal Group from DSF_SK-168 ARI-0Z 237600/
Snack Crivw Rig ACS-17 298000
Intarnat kuota for madem location DSF 5H-03018 ACS-17 101000
Meal Graup to SH-03018 ACS-17 178000
is-ufcdrmk and adding snack Crew Hig ACS-17 139
Paid sioctric token Statf House Purnama 203000
Meal Group to DSF_3T-31C Rig ARI-01 65000
Snack Crew Rig ARJ-01 location DSF 3T-31C 490000
Mineral Water group & softdrink rig craw ARJ-01 A6000]
Moal Group from DSF_3T-31C 43000
Adding Mineral Water Group, Softdrink and snack Crew Rig BOSI-28 294000/
Tekiro Measure tape 10 metor & chin strap 105000
BDSI-28 Laundry Group — == 49490

Sub Total 0.00 770840
P/A-CashAdvance [T T _ |
[ | heteby certily that the above expenditures were spent for legitimate Company butiness only ]
e Claimiant —
‘Dlt!
= ~ Manager Approval
[owse

-

| flank tnformation

10K Actount USS Account
US$ Account
Beneficlary:
HBank: Mandiri
|Account: 9000030124854

SL-Private



PT. SUPRACO INDONESIA
TIMESHEET FOR SPECIALIST OF SCHLUMBERGER

: ROBS| ANDRIYANTO MONTH : September 2025
: DDX
NO|  Date STATUS  LOCATION CORE BONUS MEAL ALLOWANCE SUPY SIGN REMARKS.
) -0.1037728.1920
1| 1Sep-25 oN DSF_SK-168 - On duty at Rig ARI-02 15 v Ao 05 Do mmealii
-0.1037728.1920
2| 2-5ep-25 OoN DSF_5K-168 - On duty at Rig ARJ-02 15 v A 05 O madbici
-0.1037728.1920
3| 3-5ep25 oN DSF_5K-168 - On duty at Rig ARJ-02 15 v Adlioelis Son nrtcibice
4| 4Sep-2s ON 5H-03018 - On duty at Rig ACS-17 1.0 v 0.1037728.1418
5| 5-5ep-25 ON 5H-03018 - On duty at Rig ACS-17 1.0 v 0.1037728.1418
6| 6Sep25 ON 5H-03018 - On duty at Rig ACS-17 1.0 v 0.1037728.1418
7| 7-sep-25 ON 5H-03018 - On duty at Rig ACS-17 1.0 v 0.1037728.1418
8| 8Sep-2s ON DSF_3T-31C - On duty at Rig ARJ-01 1.0 v 0.1037728.1481
9| 9-sep-25 ON DSF_3T-31C - On duty at Rig ARJ-01 1.0 v 0.1037728.1481
10| 10-Sep-25 ON DSF_3T-31C - On duty at Rig ARI-01 1.0 v 0.1037728.1481
11| 11-Sep-25 ON DSF_3T-31C - On duty at Rig ARI-01 1.0 v 0.1037728.1481
12| 12:Sep-25 ON DSF_3T-31C -On duty at Rig ARJ-01 1.0 v 0.1037728.1481
13| 13-sep25 | stBY
14| 14-Sep-25 | sTBY
15| 15-Sep-25 ON RGU23-P10 - On duty at Rig BDSI-28 1.0 v 0.1037728.1960
16| 16-Sep-25 OoN RGU23-P10 -On duty at Rig 8051-28 1.0 v 0.1037728.1960
17| 17-Sep-25 ON RGU23-P10 -On duty at Rig BDSI-28 1.0 v 0.1037728.1960
18| 18-Sep-25 OoN RGU23-P10 - On duty at Rig BDSI-28 1.0 v 0.1037728.1960
19| 19-Sep-25 ON RGU23-P10 -On duty at Rig 8051-28 1.0 v 0.1037728.1960
20| 20-Sep-25 OoN RGU23-F10 ~On duty at Rig BDSI-28 10 v 0.1037728.1960
21| 21-Sep-25 ON RGU23-P10 - On duty at Rig BDSI-28 1.0 v 0.1037728.1960
22| 22-Sep-25 ON RGU23-P10 - On duty at Rig BDSI-28 1.0 v 0.1037728.1960
23| 23-Sep-25 ON RGU23-P10 - On duty at Rig BDSI-28 1.0 v 0.1037728.1950
24| 24-Sep-25 ON RGU23-P10 - On duty at Rig BDS!-28 1.0 v 0.1037728.1960
25| 25-Sep-25 ON AGU23-P10 - On duty at Rig BDS!-28 1.0 v 0.1037728.1960
26| 26-Sep-25 ON RGU23-P10 - On duty at Rig BDSI-28 1.0 v 0.1037728.1960
27| 27-Sep-25 ON RGU23-P10 - On duty at Rig 8D51-28 10 v 0.1037728.1960
28| 28-Sep-25 ON RGU23-P10 - On duty at Rig BDSI-28 1.0 v 0.1037728.1960
29| 29-Sep-25 ON RGU23-P10 - On duty at Rig BDSI-28 1.0 v 0.1037728.1360
30| 30-Sep-25 ON AGU23-P10 - On duty at Rig BDSI-28 10 v 0.1037728.1960
31
PREPARED BY, REVIEWED BY, APPROVED BY,

Jﬂ'! \Ir\




Zimbra https://mserver.supraco.com’/h/printmessage?id=144658&tz=Asia/Bangkok
Zimbra mitra.dewi@supraco.com
FW: Timesheet and expenses claim (September 2025)
From : Nada Salsabila Irsani <NIrsani@slb.com> Fri, Oct 03, 2025 10:24 PM
Subject : FW: Timesheet and expenses claim (September 2025) 4 attachments
To : Mitra Dewi <mitra.dewi@supraco.com>, fadhil adha <fadhil.adha@supraco.com>
Cc : Putri Dian Maharani <PMaharani@slb.com>, La Wangiwana <LWangiwana@slb.com>,
Catur Muharjab <CMuharjab@slb.com>

Dear Mba @mitra.dewi and Mas @fadhil.adha@supraco.com,
Please find below comments:
September

No Name Timesheet Comment |Final Count

[CORE [Meal
1 Catur Muharjab ¢ Add 4x0.5 bonus for one man show= 2 28 26
|(core + additional = 26+2)
Expenses are approved
Thank you
Best Regards,
Nada
SLB-Private
SLB-Private
From: Catur Muharjab <CMuharjab@slb.coms>
Sent: Wednesday, October 1, 2025 8:05 PM
I dari 2

06/10/2025, 08.16



PT. SUPRACO INDONESIA

TIMESHEET FOR SPECIALIST OF SCHLUMBERGER

Catur Muharjab MONTH : September 2025
DD X Cross Train

1 1-Sep-25 ON DSF 37-318, Clnd'uﬂ_t)? 37-318, Job 1D : D.1037728.1380 0K oK

2 2Sep-25 ON DSF 3T-318, Onduty DSF 3T-318, Job ID : 0.1037728.1380 oK oK

3 3-5ep-25 OoN PUNG25_0002iNJ Onduty PUNG25_D002INJ, Job ID : 0.1037728.1966 oK OK

4 4-Sep-25 ON PUNG25_D002INJ Onduty PUNG5_D002iNJ, Job 1D : 0.1037728.1966 oK oK

5 5-Sep-25 ON PUNG25_0002iINJ Onduty PUNG25_0002IN), Job 1D : 0.1037728.1966 OoX oK

6 6-Sep-25 ON PUNG25_0002INJ Onduty PUNG25_0002INJ, Job 1D : 0.1037728.1966 Ox oK

7 7-Sep-25 ON PUNG25_0002iN} Onduty PUNG25_0002IN), Job ID : D.1037728.1966 0K OK

8 8-Sep-25 ON PUNG25_0002INJ Onduty PUNG25_0002INJ, Job 1D : 0.1037728.1966 oKX oK

L] 9-Sep-25 ON PUNG25_0002IN} Onduty PUNG25_D002IN), Job ID : 0.1037728.1966 oK oK

10 10-5ep-25 ON PUNG25_0002INJ Onduty PUNG25_0002IN), Job ID : 0.1037728.1966 0K oK

11 11-Sep-25 ON PUNG25_0002INJ Onduty PUNG25_0002INJ, Job 10 : 0.1037728.1966 oK OK

12 12-Sep-25 ON PUNG25_0002IN} Onduty PUNG25_0002INJ, Job ID : 0.1037728.1966 Ok 0K

13 13-Sep-25 ON DSF 4F-652 Onduty D5F 4F-65Z, Job ID : 0.1066081.63 0K oK 15X
14 14-52p-25 ON DSF 4F-652 Onduty DSF 4F-65Z, Job ID : 0.1066081.63 0K oK 15X
15 15-5ep-25 ON DSF 4F-652 Onduty D5F 4F-652, Job ID : 0.1066051.63 oK oK 15X
16 16-Sep-25 ON DSF 4F-652 Onduty DSF 4F-65Z, Job ID : 0.1066081.63 oK oK 15X%
17 17-Sep-25 ON DSF 4F-652 Onduty DSF 4F-65Z, Job ID : 0.1066081.63 OK oK

18 18-Sep-25 ON DSF 4F-652 Onduty D5F 4F-652, Job ID : 0.1066081.63 QK oK

19 15-Sep-25 ON DSF 4F-652 Onduty DSF 4F-652, Job ID : 0.1066081.63 oK OK

0 24-Sep-25 ON DSF 5F-942 Onduty DSF 5F-342, Job ID : 0.1066081.64 oK oK
21 25-Sep-25 ON DSF 5F-942 Onduty DSF 5F-942, Job I1D : 0.1066081.64 0K oK
22 26-Sep-25 ON DSF 5F-942 Onduty DSF 5F-942, Job ID : 0.1066081 64 OK oK

23 27-5ep-25 ON DSF SF-942 Onduty DSF 5F-942, Job ID : 0.1066081 64 oKX oK

24 28-5ep-25 ON DSF 5F-942 Onduty DSF 5F-942, Job ID : 0.1066081 64 oK oK

25 25-5ep-15 ON DSF 5F-942 Onduty DSF 5F-942, Job ID : 0.1066081.64 (¢].4 oK

26 30-Sep-25 ON DSF 5F-942 Onduty DSF 5F-942, Job ID : 0.1066081 64 oK OK

PREPARED 8Y, REVIEWED BY, APPROVED BY,

Catur Muharjab

SLB-Private




ING EXPENSE STATEMENT

Gn: - = = = v ... .

Employes  Name Catur Muharjaty Segmant/Departrment Well Constraction Measurement - Dur Base

Accounting Yog: S — Manages La Wangiwana

Activity Code = Purpitsn

Legal Entity ;

® DA Only OMultipie Currencies [ @ Bussiness Related 0 Persannel Related —
Yo Mraky sfter work on g (05 AT.110) Indonesis A0, D00
You Meals before work on rig (FUNGIS DOO2INI) Indonmeus 233,000
N Buying snack and mineral water for lacation [PUNG25_0002IN). O 1007720 1966) Indanesa 00, 00
Vi Maals alter waork on rig TPLINGLS CII'J'JIN_A Indaneus a0 |
Yei___|Whnals before work on i [05F 41-id] . Indonesia 114,000 |
Yas Wiying snack and minetal water fof [oeation (D4 45652, Job 1D © D106B0RT. 61} Indonesia 000, 000
¥ou Mealy aftor work an g (8F 45052 o 220,000
Yes By mamasuring took for work on leid Indanatis 110,000
i Mesh before work on rig (DAF SF-647) Indonesia 1R, (00
Mo Buying wnack and mineral water for ocation (DG 45942, Job 10 | O L6608 64) Instuneua 00,000
Yru Top up electricity bill for staff house ndaneia 504,500

P{A - Cash Advante
[ | hernby cortify that the abowe expendituies were spent for legitimate Comuny Business only ]
. Clalmant

{Date - 30 September 2075

Date

| Dl

Bank informatian

@ 1R Accodunt

Beneficlary,
atnh: Mandi

Account: 117-00-0424646-8

s

Catur Muhatjab

Manager Approval

GeoMarket Approval

0 US5 Account

S5LB-Private



Zimbra

Zimbra

https://mserver.supraco.com/h/printmessage?id=144659&tz=Asia/Bangkok

mitra.dewi@supraco.com

FW: September 2025 Timesheet Submission of Dedy Saputra

From : Nada Salsabila Irsani <NIrsani@slb.com>

Subject : FW: September 2025 Timesheet Submission of Dedy Saputra

To : fadhil adha <fadhil.adha@supraco.com>, Mitra Dewi <mitra.dewi@supraco.com>

Cc : Putri Dian Maharani <PMaharani@slb.com>, La Wangiwana <LWangiwana@slb.com>,
Dedy Saputra <DSaputral0@slb.com>

Dear Mba @mitra.dewi and Mas @fadhil.adha@supraco.com,

Please find below comments:

Fri, Oct 03, 2025 10:26 PM

September
No Name Timesheet Comment [Final Count
CORE [Meal
1 Dedy Saputra s Add 1x0.5 bonus for one man show 19.5 18

¢ Add 1x1 bonus for working in 2 rig
simultaneously

(core + additional = 18+0.5+1)

Expenses are approved

Thank you
Best Regards,

Nada

SLB-Private

From: Dedy Saputra <DSaputral0@slb.com>
Sent: Wednesday, October 1, 2025 9:02 AM

To: Elvian Herianto Barus <EBarus@slb.com>; La Wangiwana <LWangiwana@slb.com>; Nada Salsabila Irsani <NIrsani@slb.com>; Mitra Dewi

| dari 2

1 attachment

06/10/2025, 08.15



SUPRACO

PT. SUPRACO INDONESIA

TIMESHEET FOR SPECIALIST OF SCHLUMBERGER

NAME : Dedy Saputra MONTH September
POSITION : DD Specialist cross Train Dx
1 1-Sep-24
2 2-Sep-24
3 3-Sep-24
4 | 4-sep-24
5 5-Sep-24
6 6-Sep-24
7 | 7-Sep-24
8 | 8Sep-24
9 5-Sep-24
10 | 10-Sep-24
11 | 11-Sep-24
12 | 12-Sep-24
13 | 13-3ep-24 oM P_MINA25_0023 “Onduty P_MINA25_0023 , JobID: 0.1037728.1884 oK oK
14 | 14-5ep-24 ON P_MINA25_0023 “"Onduty P_MINA25_0023 , JoblD: 0.1037728.1884 Ox oK -
15 | 15-5ep-24 ON P_MINA25 0023 "Onduty P_MINA25_0023, loblD: 0.1037728.1884 OK oK
16 16-Sep-24 OoN P_MINA25_0023 "Onduty P_MINA25_0023, JoblD: 0.1037728.1884 oK OK
17 | 17-5ep-28 ON P_MINA25_0023 "Onduty P_MINA25_0D023 , JobiD: 0.1037728.1884 oK oK
18 | 18-Sep-24 ON P_MINAJS 0023 "Onduty P_MINA25_0023 , JoblD: 0.1037725.1884 oK oK
19 | 19-Sep-24 ON P_MINA25 0023 "Onduty P_MINA25_0023 , JoblD: 0.1037728.1884 OK OK -
20 | 20Sep-24 ON P_MINA25 D023 "Onduty P_MINA2S5_0023, JoblD: 0.1037728.1884 oK oK -
21 | 21-Sep-24 ON P_MINA25_0023 "Oncduty P_MINA25_0023 , JoblD: 0.1037728.1884 Ok oK -
22 | 22-Sep-24 ON P_MINA2S5 0023 "Onduty P_MINA25_D023 , JoblD: 0.1037725.1884 oK oK -
23| 23-Sep-24 ON P_MINA25 0023 "Onduty P_MINA25_0023 , JoblD: 0.1037728.1884 QK oK -
24 | 24-Sep-24 ON DSF SH-0406C "Onduty DSF SH-0406C , JoblD: 0.1037728.1885 oK oK -
"Onduty DSF SH-0406C , JobID: 0.1037728.1885""Onduty P_BEKA25_005, -
25 | 25-5ep-24 ON DSF SH-0406C/P_BEKA25_005 ty JobiD: 0,103??23.1890'[' Y - oK oK 1.5 Additienal Boaus
26 | 26-Sep-24 ON P_BEKA25_005 Onduty P_BEXA25_005 , JoblD: 0.1037728,1850 oK oK -
27 | 27-5ep-24 ON P_BEKA25 005 Onduty P_BEKA25_005, JoblD: 0.1037728.1890 oK oK -
28 | 285ep-24 ON P_BEKA25_005 Onduty P_BEKA2S_00S , JobID: 0.1037728 1890 oK oK
29 | 29-Sep-24 ON P_BEKA25_005 Onduty P_BEKA25_005, JoblD: 0.1037728.18%90 oK OK -
30 | 30-Sep-24 ON P_BEKA25 005 Onduty P_BERA25 005, JoblD: 0.1037728.1890 0K oK -
Total Days : 19.5
PREPARED BY, REVIEWED BY, APPROVED BY,
DTy ST

SLB-Private




Zimbra https://mserver.supraco.com/h/printmessage?id=14466 1 &tz=Asia/Bangkok

Zimbra mitra.dewi@supraco.com

FW: Timesheet & Expenses September 2025

From : Nada Salsabila Irsani <NIrsani@slb.com> Fri, Oct 03, 2025 10:28 PM
Subject : FW: Timesheet & Expenses September 2025 - 3 attachments
To : Mitra Dewi <mitra.dewi@supraco.com>, fadhil adha <fadhil.adha@supraco.com>

Cc : La Wangiwana <LWangiwana@slb.com>, Putri Dian Maharani <PMaharani@slb.com>,
Muhamad Edwin Sahilatua <MSahilatua@slb.com>

Dear Mba @mitra.dewi and Mas @fadhil.adha@supraco.com,

Please find below comments:

September
No Name Timesheet Comment Final Count
CORE iMeal
1 Edwin Sahilatua e Add 2x1 bonus for working in 2 rigs 32 30

simultaneously
(core + additional = 30+2)

Expenses are approved

Thank you
Best Regards,
Nada

SLB-Private

From: Muhamad Edwin Sahilatua <MSahilatua@slb.com>
Sent: Wednesday, October 1, 2025 7:13 AM
To: Nada Salsabila Irsani <NIrsani@slb.com>

1 dari 2 06/10/2025, 08.11



PT. SUPRACO INDONESIA
TIMESHEET FOR SPECIALIST OF SCHLUMBERGER

: M. EDWIN SAHILATUA MONTH : SEPTEMBER 2025
: DD SPECIALIST

NO DATE STATUS LOCATION ACTIVITIES CORE BONUS MEAL ALLOWANCE SUPY SIGN. REMARKS

1 1-Sep-25 ON RGU23-P11 On Duty at Rig BDSI-28 v v Sekar Ayu 0.1037728.1557
2 2-Sep-25 ON RGU23-P11 On Duty at Rig BDSI-28 v v Sekar Ayu 0.1037728.1557
3 3-Sep-25 ON RGU23-P11 On Duty at Rig BDS!-28 v 1] Sekar Ayu 0.1037728.1557
4 4-Sep-25 ON RGU23-P11 On Duty at Rig BDSI-28 v v Sekar Ayu 0.1037728.1557
5 5-5ep-25 ON RGU23-P11 On Duty at Rig BDSI-28 v v Sekar Ayu 0.1037728.1557
6 6-Sep-25 (o] RGU23-P11 & P_KERAZ5_PO1 |On Duty at Rig BDSI-28 & On Duty at Rig GW 338 v v Sekar Ayu & Reinaldi 0.1037728.1557 & 0.1037728.1902

7 7-Sep-25 ON P_KERA25 PO1 On Duty at Rig GW 338 v v Reinaldi 0.1037728.1902
8 8-5ep-25 ON P_KERA25_PO1 On Duty at Rig GW 338 v ¥ Reinaldi 0.1037728.1902
9 9-Sep-25 ON P_KERA2S_PO1 On Duty at Rig GW 338 v v Reinaldi 0.1037728.1902
10| 10-Sep-25 ON P_KERAZ5_PO1 On Duty at Rig GW 338 v v Reinaldi 0.1037728.1902
11| 11-Sep-25 ON P_KERA25_PO1 On Duty at Rig GW 338 v ¥ Reinaldi 0.1037728.1302
12| 12-Sep-25 ON P_KERA25_PO1 On Duty at Rig GW 338 v ) Reinaldi 0.1037728.1902
13| 13-Sep-25 ON P_KERA25_PO1 On Duty at Rig GW 338 v i | Reinaldi 0.1037728.1902
14| 14-Sep-25 ON P_KERA2S_PO1 On Duty at Rig GW 338 v v Reinaldi 0.1037728.1302
15| 15-Sep-25 ON P_KERA25_PO1 On Duty at Rig GW 338 v v Reinaldi 0.1037728.1902
16| 16-Sep-25 ON P_KERA25_PO1 On Duty at Rig GW 338 v v Reinaldi 0.1037728.1502
17| 17-Sep-25 ON P_KERAZS_PO1 On Duty at Rig GW 338 v v Reinaldi 0.1037728.1902
18| 18-Sep-25 ON P_KERAZS5_PO1 On Duty at Rig GW 338 v v Reinaldi 0.1037728.1902
19| 19-Sep-25 ON P_KERA25_PO1 On Duty at Rig GW 338 v v Reinaldi 0.1037728.1902
20| 20-Sep-25 ON P_KERA25_P01 & RGU23_P10 |On Duty at Rig GW 338 & On Duty at Rig BDSI-28 v v Reinaldi & Muhammad Ridho | 0.1037728.1902 & 0.1037728.1960
21| 21-Sep-25 ON RGU23_P10 On Duty at Rig BDSI-28 v v Muhammad Ridho 0.1037728.1960
22| 22-Sep-25 ON RGU23_P10 On Duty at Rig BDSI-28 v v Muhammad Ridho 0.1037728.1960
23| 23-Sep-25 ON RGU23_P10 On Duty at Rig BDSI-28 v v Muhammad Ridho 0.1037728.1960
24| 24-Sep-25 ON RGU23_P10 On Duty at Rig BDSI-28 v ) Muhammad Ridho 0.1037728.1960
25| 25-Sep-25 ON RGU23_P10 On Duty at Rig BDSI-28 Y v Muhammad Ridho 0.1037728.1960
26| 26-Sep-25 ON RGU23_P10 On Duty at Rig BDSI-28 v v Muhammad Ridho 0.1037728.1960
27| 27-Sep-25 ON RGU23_P10 On Duty at Rig BDSI-28 v v Muhammad Ridho 0.1037728.1960
28| 28-5ep-25 ON RGU23_P10 On Duty at Rig BDSI-28 ¥ v Muhammad Ridho 0.1037728.1960
29| 29-Sep-25 ON RGU23_P10 On Duty at Rig BDSI-28 v v Muhammad Ridho 0.1037728.1960
30| 30-Sep-25 ON RGU23_P10 On Duty at Rig BDSI-28 v v Muhammad Ridho 0.1037728.1960

PREPARED BY, REVIEWED BY, APPROVED 8Y,




e R EEEE— ING EXPENSE STATEMENT E—

Employes

Gin: EQ4I7T3 Date :
Name Mokgrmad Edwin Sab sty Segment/Department WM EHA
Accounting Unit Masager - Ehvian K. Bana
Aty Coce Purpose
legal € Entity
[ oo Ofoltigle Correncies ] [0 Bussiness Reored O Persoonel Related ]

Dinner with crew SLB Rig GW 338

9/11/2025 Snack crew Rig GW 338 443 449400
Lunch with crew 5LB Rig GW 338 173600 173500
Internet payment for job at Rig BDSI-28 109990 109590
9/23/2015 Rubber Safety Shoes Size 42 150000 150000
9/26/2025 Snack crew Rig BDSI-28 362300 362300

P/A - Cash Advance

l 1 hereby certify that the sbove expenditures were spent for legitimate Company butiness caly I

Manager Approval —_—
Date l

——————GeoMariet Roprovel —

Jowe |

Bark Information

IDR Account USS Account
LSS Account

Sensfciay
Bank: Mandiri
Account: 1370005621319

SLB-Private



FULLERTON

HEALTH

Assistancesfs
& Healthcare

Global

Global Assistance Medical Centre

RECAPITULATION INVOICE
PT SUPRACO INDONESIA
JAKARTA
PERIODE AUGUST 2025

Affordable and Accessible Care for All in Asia Pacific

350,000

1 PHYSICAL ASSESSMENT
2 EYE CHECKING QOLEH SPECIALIS MATA 350,000
3 AUDIOMETRY 40,000
4 SPIROMETRY 40,000
5 CHEST X RAY 100,000
<] ECG 37,000
7 TREADMILL 350,000
8 LUMBAL XRAY 400,000
9 USG WHOLE ABDOMEN 350,000
10 DENTAL EXAMINATION BY DENTIST 250,000
11 BLOOD CHEMISTRY - COMPLETE BLOOD COUNT 37,500
12 BLOOD GROUP 37,500
13 SERUM ELECTROLYTES(NATRIUM, KALIUM,CHLORIDE) 112,500
14 BLOOD CHEMISTRY - FASTING BLOOD SUGAR 37,500
15 BLOOD SUGAR 2ZHRS PP 37,500
16 HBA1C 286,000
17 BLOOD CHEMISTRY - LIVER ENZYMES (SGOT, SGPT, GGT) 112,500
18 FOSFATASE ALKALI 37,500
19 TOTAL BILIRUBINE 37,500
20 BILLIRUBIN DIRECT 37,500
2; R Muha ma d Edwin BILLIRUBIN INDIRECT 37,500
Sahilatua CHOLINESTERASE 190,000
23 BLOOD CHEMISTRY - CHOLESTEROL PROFILE (TOTAL CHOLESTEROL, HDL, 150,000

LDL, TRIGLYCERIDE) !

24 UREUM 37,500
25 BLOOD CHEMISTRY - CREATININ 37,500
26 BLOOD CHEMISTRY - URIC ACID 37,500
27 URINE ANALYSIS 25,000
28 STOOL ANALYSIS 300,000
29 VDRL 55,000
30 TPHA 65,000
31 HBSAG 252,000
3z ANTIHBS 105,000
33 ANTI HCV TEST 430,000
34 URINE - CANNABIS 40,000
35 URINE - OPIATE 40,000
36 URINE - AMPHETAMINE 40,000
a7 URINE - MDMA 40,000
38 URINE - COCAINE 40,000
39 URINE - BENZODIAZEPINE 40,000
40 METAMPHETAMINE 40,000
41 APUS DARAH TEPI 190,000
42 PHR CERTIFICATE 150,000
TOTAL 5,382,500

PT. Global Asistensi Medika

Cibis Nine Lantai Dasar
JI. TB. Simatupang No. 2
Cilandak, Pasar Minggu
Jakarta 12560 - Indonesia

Indonesia * Papua New Guinea

T:+62(21) 299 78 088
F:+62(21) 299 78956
fullertonhealth.co.id

* Cambiodia » C

hina « Hong Kang =

Malaysia « The Philippines «

Singapare « Vietnam




	PI0690 SUM VAR OCTOBER 2025 - 1-30 SEPTEMBER 2025 DNM.pdf
	SUM VAR OCTOBER 2025 - 1-30 SEPTEMBER 2025 DNM.pdf
	DNM.pdf
	Edwin.pdf

