
PT.SUPRACO INDONESIA ORIGINAL
2nd Floor, Jl.Kapten Tendean No.24

Mampang Prapatan

Jakarta 12720 - Indonesia

Phone : 7191070 (Hunting)

Fax. : 7191077

e-mail : finance@supraco.com

PI

Invoice No. : PI0731/INV/2025

Company Code : 12
Date : 25 November 2025

Contract No. : CW2712367 (Amendemen No.2)

Contract Expiration Date : 31 December 2026

For the period of : NOVEMBER 2025

Customer No. :

Contract Scope : SERVICE AGREEMENT Requester : Finance Dept / Account Payable

No Part No PO GR COST CENTRE Quantity Unit Price Total

LOCATION : DURI IDR

1 SUPRACO SUM VAR NOVEMBER 2025 - 1-31 OCTOBER 2025 ID100130 1  Each 18,427,500       18,427,500                                                 

HELPER ACEH.

Adm Fee

Total Payment 18,427,500

PT. Supraco Indonesia

NPWP : 01.306.780.6.062.000  

Note : Please find the attachment (Billing Summary) 18,427,500

In Words : ( Rupiah : Eighteen Million Four Hundred Twenty Seven Thousand Five Hundred Only )

I certify that this Invoice is true and correct that payment thereof has not

been Invoiced or received previously.

    Please remit to  :

            PT. SUPRACO INDONESIAPT. SUPRACO INDONESIA

            CABANG BUNCIT RAYA - JAKARTA SELATANBank Account    : 905.021069.900

Bank Name         : HSBC INDONESIA

Adress       : WTC Building Jakarta Name : NOVIA INGGRIANI

Swift Code         : HSBCIDJA    Title : PROJECT MANAGER

Total Payment by Schlumberger

SUPRACO

PI

PT. M-I In​d​o​n​e ​s​i​a​
Gedung Wisma Mulia  Lantai 45,  Jalan Jend. Gatot Subroto No.42, RT.003 RW.002                                             

Kuningan Barat, Mampang Prapatan,  Jakarta Selatan, DKI JAKARTA 12710

Description

                                                                                     



BILLING SUMMARY (BACK UP INVOICE SCHLUMBERGER)

: NOVEMBER 2025

PERIODE TIMESHEET : October 2025 -                   

PROJECT :  CW 2712367 (OSP/SERVICE CONTRACT)

ADM Fee

GIN 5.5%

HOURS
RATE PER 

HOURS
TOTAL g=a+f h=8%*g i=g+h

SGN

1
Rahmad Maulidan 171078 0 [Aceh] OSP Helper ID100130 218 22,004 4,796,931 800,000 1,903,370 7,500,301 412,547 7,912,847

2
Wibowo Budi Santoso 171078 0

[Aceh] OSP 

Electrician MI
ID100130 284 23,121 6,566,474 1,400,000 2,000,000 9,966,474 548,156 10,514,630

502 45,126 11,363,405 2,200,000 3,903,370 17,466,800 960,700 18,427,500

NILAI PO

NO NAME
EMP 

NO.
POSITION COST CENTRE

OVERTIME
Sub Total Base 

Cost per month
Total Payment

Expense Severance



From : mitra dewi <mitra.dewi@supraco.com>
Subject : FW: [Ext] Fwd: Timesheet Rahmad Maulidan &

Wibowo Budi S October2025
To : 'muhammad nur' <muhammad.nur@supraco.com>

Zimbra muhammad.nur@supraco.com

FW: [Ext] Fwd: Timesheet Rahmad Maulidan & Wibowo Budi S October2025

Tue, Nov 25, 2025 02:04 PM
 2 attachments

 
 
From: Kirana Widiani Lestari
Sent: Monday, November 10, 2025 8:47 AM
To: mitra.dewi <mitra.dewi@supraco.com>
Cc: Andrey Rasyid <ARasyid@slb.com>; Rahmad Maulidan <rm.maulidan@gmail.com>; Welria Yogi Riady
Putra <WPutra@slb.com>
Subject: RE: [Ext] Fwd: Timesheet Rahmad Maulidan & Wibowo Budi S October2025
 
Hello Mas,
The timesheet and expense are approved.
 
 
Best Regards,
Kirana W. Lestari
ING Well Construction – MI DS/ES Workforce
E: klestari@slb.com | M: +62 811 8797 26
 
 
 
 

SLB-Private

From: Rahmad Maulidan <rm.maulidan@gmail.com>
Sent: Saturday, November 8, 2025 7:17 PM
To: Kirana Widiani Lestari <klestari@slb.com>
Subject: [Ext] Fwd: Timesheet Rahmad Maulidan & Wibowo Budi S October2025
 
---------- Forwarded message --------- Dari: Rahmad Maulidan <rm. maulidan@ gmail. com> Date: Sel, 4 Nov 2025 07. 56 Subject: Timesheet Rahmad Maulidan & Wibowo Budi S October2025 To: <WPutra@ slb. com> Cc: <ARasyid@ slb. com>,
 

 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
Dari: Rahmad Maulidan <rm.maulidan@gmail.com>
Date: Sel, 4 Nov 2025 07.56
Subject: Timesheet Rahmad Maulidan & Wibowo Budi S October2025
To: <WPutra@slb.com>
Cc: <ARasyid@slb.com>, <mitra.dewi@supraco.com>
 

Mas Weli,
Berikut timesheet & Expanse bulan October 2025 Rahmad Maulidan & Wibowo Budi S
Terima kasih
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Rahmad Maulidan TS & Expense Oct 2025.pdf
2 MB 

Wibowo Budi TS & Expense Oct 2025.pdf
3 MB 
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